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1 year, 29 months ago.[The surgical treatment of benign
colorectal tumors in the elderly. Retrospective study of 67
cases]. The authors report a retrospective study of 67 patients
aged from 62 to 79 years (mean: 72.36). These patients
underwent operation between 1980 and 1993 for the following
benign colorectal tumours: diverticular abscess, diverticulitis
(inflamed segment), diverticular tumour, colorectal stricture,
stenosing tumour, prolapse, or fistula, polyp, fibroma. The aim
of surgery was the resection of the lesion and the exclusion of
the risk of perforation or stenosis. With regard to the type of
operation, they studied various resections of the colon (after
resection of the rectum) and resection of the colon or caecum in
the case of polyps, diverticular abscess, diverticulitis and

https://cinurl.com/2sFgU3


fibrous stricture. The per- and post-operative morbidity and
mortality were evaluated according to the Brest classification.
The following results were obtained: 7 patients were operated
on by resection of the caecum (10.4%); 11 patients by resection
of the lower colon (16.1%); 45 by total colectomy (67.2%); 1 by
partial colectomy (1.5%). There were 7 post-operative
complications (10.4%). Per-operative mortality was 3 cases
(4.5%). The overall post-operative morbidity was 21%. The
mortality and morbidity of colorectal resection were clearly
related to the age of the patients and to the seriousness of the
lesions. This study shows the need of a long follow-up period
and sufficient preoperative discussion. A total colectomy in the
case of benign colorectal tumours in elderly patients is
mandatory. It should be combined with a total care in ger
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